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Bayreuth…Building was Flooded.  
 
The church in Bayreuth began renovating their church building this Spring. They were enjoying 
painting each room, putting up new curtains, signs, and banners. All but one room had been 
renovated when Bayreuth got another rain that overloaded the city’s drainage system. The pipes 
in the street are too small for this type of rainfall. Although our building drainage system was 
upgraded, it was no match for the deluge that came. While the water was still rising, some of our 
members began saving our electronic equipment. We lost a few pieces of furniture but because of 
our upgrades, the loss was minimal.  
 
Our landlord has appealed to the mayor of Bayreuth to upgrade the city’s drainage system. Please 
pray for our landlord’s voice to be heard in the mayor’s office. 
 
We will be meeting in another location until the beginning of November. Please pray for this 
congregation to stay encouraged in the Lord.  
 

                                    
                                   Hadassah Joy                                                                     Calvary Dallas    

Great-Granddaughters… 
To begin the year right, we welcomed a new great-granddaughter into our family. Lily’s 
daughter, Hadassah Joy, was born on January 31, 2023. 
 
On August 03, 2023, weighing in at 6 pounds and 8 ounces, Calvary Dallas made her entrance 
into this world.  This is the first child for Zachary and Grace.    
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Sinti…Evangelism and Missions 
Two of our preachers, Remo and Menele, keep the theme of missions alive in the local 
congregations. They travel, as the Apostle Paul did, to encourage churches not to forget the poor 
believers in other countries. They also travel to Romania, Bulgaria and Ukraine, encouraging 
believers and helping them in their evangelistic efforts.  
 
Through these efforts, Sinti in Ukraine who cannot flee the country are receiving care packages 
and money. These relief efforts are coordinated with Sinti in Romania. The Sinti from Romania 
travel into the country to preach the Gospel and encourage the believers. When it is not possible 
for the Sinti in Ukraine to leave their city, the Sinti from other countries travel to them delivering 
as much help as possible. Please pray for the safety of these faithful men who give themselves for 
the cause of Christ.  
 

Prayer updates AND REQUESTS 
  1.  Praise the Lord, we are healthy! Thank you for praying for us! 
  2. Pray for Bruce for stress and high blood pressure problems. 
  3. We have two short trips to the States in the next 3 months 
  4.  There is a need for assistance in the ministries in Germany during our absence. 
  5.  Gypsies in the Ukraine are suffering very difficult and dangerous conditions. 
  6.  The Bayreuth church can resume services in their facility in November. 
  7.  Four Gypsy couples from Romania will visit our churches in Germany in November.  They 
will be giving “eyewitness” reports from the work in Romania, Bulgaria, and Ukraine. 

Jim and Becky White 


